# Testimony for Task Force Meeting Andrea Cota Eigner

f:

S.

January 9th 2014

Page 1 of 3

Its all about the money and not about the best interest of our children and families.

My name is Andrea Cota Eigner from Cromwell, Ct., mother of Justin Charles Eigner.

I am a member of We the People and many other organizations that fight for the rights of Families and our U.S. Constitution.

I have not seen my son in a year and a half, due to Susan Cousineau's fraudulent acts, who has the nerve to sit here on the task force, we the people designed, to rid the family court of criminals like her. She is the ring leader of all deceptions and evil greedy routine play acts. She is the devil in disguise, a statement one of my family members uses often to describe her.

I have been dragged through the Middletown corrupt family court system, (funded by the AFCC, a nationwide child trafficking group), since September 2008 when my son was legally kidnapped by his father, who no longer wanted to pay child support, with the assistance and abetting of court employees and other business people who are only interested in taking money and assets from parents and children. To name a few, Susan Cousineau, Judge Gerard Adelman, both AFCC members. Judge Harry Calmar, Dr. Donald Heibel, AMPS, Dr. Black-who deceased a year ago from a sudden heart attack, he also trafficked our children and threw them into the hands of abusers. All of whom have been hired by Susan Cousineau, who makes sure everyone gets paid well, while destroying children and their families.

I'll never forget the most traumatic day on October 6<sup>th</sup> 2008, 5 years ago, when Susan Cousineau interrogated and threatened me for 4 hours in a small side room in the court hall regarding my religious beliefs as a Catholic, when she told me I would never see my son again, and if I did not sign physical custody over to my ex. Mr. Eigner, she would put me away somewhere and drug me until I did. Sickened and worried about my son whom I hadn't seen in weeks, I signed him over thinking I would find a way to get him home soon, not knowing how corrupt at the time the family court system is. Another day in the court, two men in suits got off the elevator near the coffee shop, one saying to the other, "If you give Sue Cousineau 12 to 15 k she'll do whatever you want." Testimony for Task Force Meeting January 9th 2014 Andrea Cota Eigner

Page 2 of 3

### continued-

ŝ

With Cousineau and Dornfield on the task force we will not be able to get access to the billing records, because they know they will be punished for their wicked money crimes. They need to be ordered to step down immediately. Their greed is unchanging.

I have done auditing along with many others on bills forced upon parents. After talking to many parent victims regarding their experiences with Susan Cousineau they revealed they are traumatized by her actions in the taking of their children and her over billing them by 6 to 12 times the allotted hourly rate of \$50 per hour, according to the office of the public defender. I have a sample of my long bills here, proving her over billing for exaggerated services in which she created to keep her money ring going. I also have an audit report here proving her zealous greed and horrific stealings from victim families who she preys upon with her child trafficking and racketeering business.

Its all about the money not about the best interest of our children and families.

Ms. Cousineau has not met with my son Justin more then once in 5 years, he did not even know who she was when I asked him several times about her a couple years ago. She did not return any of my calls in the past, but two of them. Ms. Cousineau does not care about the well being of my son, and is only concerned with filling her pockets with cash.

Attached is transcript from Aug. 12, 2013, see cover page, and pages 1 and 8, where Ms. Cousineau states she is Former GAL, and then lies in court on the record Dec. 23<sup>rd</sup> 2013 stating she never said that she was no longer on the case. She even told me so herself in the court hall, she was no longer on the case. She plays the role whenever she feels it suits her, but yet never does her proper job as a GAL.

She illegally arranged for Judge Adelman to try and overturn a Federal Judges decision of my debts to her which were dismissed in bankruptcy court, in which the Federal bankruptcy court had full knowledge of her assistance and abetting in the legal kidnapping of my son Justin, which did not justify her corrupt bills to me of \$6,000. She also threatened my home equity.

#### Testimony for Task Force Meeting January 9th 2014 Andrea Cota Eigner Page 3 of 3

continued-

Ì

Susan Cousineau and other GAL's and their cronies, attack parents with threats, interrogations, religion, work schedules, just about anything they can conjure up in order to continue their money referral system. They intentionally cause disastrous disagreements between the parents to enable them to keep coming back to the courts to fight over the children, so they can collect more money.

After confronting one of the Judges in my case in a closed courtroom, saying to him, I know what is going on in here, you people lie cheat and steal to make money off my child. The judge replied, if you know whats going on and what we are doing, then why come in here wasting everyone's time... All of this of course was stricken from transcripts. Another day in court Susan Cousineau threw at me, my letters of good character friends family and professionals wrote and signed on my behalf, some of whom testified too ... Cousineau stated, you could have signed them all. Imagine this dirty rat accusing me of signing a stack of goodwill letters from my loved ones. Behind bars is where criminals like her belong where she can repent for the rest of her life for the lives she took away from so many children and parents...

Family courts need to be abolished and criminals kept away from innocent victims. The corrupt AFCC needs to be shut down entirely.

Its all about the money, not about the best interest of children and families.

Andrea Cola Eigner Andrea Cota Eigner January Hh. 2014

# Law Office of Sue A. Cousineau 516 Main Street, Suite 25

Middletown, Connecticut 06457

Ph: (860) 346-1783 Fax:(860) 346-1785

Justin Eigner 163 Cynthia Lane A-4 Middletown, CT 06457

•

•

Dec 30, 2008

File #:	2479
Inv #·	1944

RE: Eigner, Scott v Eigner, Andrea re: Justin dkt #FA05-4002759-S

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Oct-21-08	Telephone Conference with Amps.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
Oct-22-08	Telephone Conference with S. Eigner.	0.30	\$75.00	SAC
Oct-23-08	Receipt and review of motion.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
Oct-24-08	Telephone Conference with Attorney Magliochetti.	0.35	\$87.50	SAC
	Receipt and review of motions.	0.40	\$100.00	SAC
	Telephone Conference with Donald Polansky.	0.35	\$87.50	SAC
Oct-27-08	Court.	3.10	\$775.00	SAC
Oct-28-08	Receipt and review of multiple references re: mother.	0.40	\$100.00	SAC
Dec-02-08	Deposition of reclaim.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
Dec-10-08	Telephone Conference with Dr. Hiebel.	0.40	\$100.00	SAC
Dec-15-08	Conf. with Dr. Hiebel re: Christmas access	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
Dec-17-08	Telephone Conference with Dr. Hiebel	0.20	\$50.00	SAC

Totals

Total Fees, Disbursements	\$525.00
Previous Balance Previous Payments	\$0.00 \$0.00
Balance Due Now	\$525.00

.

.

# TRUST STATEMENT

		Disbursements	Receipts
Oct-08-08	Received From: Scott Eigner Retainer		5,000.00
Oct-10-08	Paid To: Law Office of Sue A. Cousineau Payment for invoice: 1931	3,950.00	
Dec-30-08	Paid To: Law Office of Sue A. Cousineau Payment for invoice: 1944	1,050.00	
	Total Trust	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00
	Trust Balance		\$0.00

10.16

Docket # MMX- FA5-4002759-S	::	SUPERIOR COURT
SCOTT EIGNER	**	J.D. MIDDLESEX
v.	**	AT MIDDLETOWN
ANDREA COTA EIGNER	**	October 14, 2009

# MOTION FOR ORDER RE: PAYMENT OF GUARDIAN AD LITEM FEES

The undersigned guardian ad litern for the subject minor children respectfully requests that this honorable court enter orders concerning the payment of the guardian ad litern fees and avers the following in support thereof:

- On or about October 6, 2008, the undersigned was appointed as guardian ad litem for the minor children in the above captioned matter by means of an Agreement of the Parties of the same date, which Agreement became an order of the court on that date.
- Said order read "Father shall pay a \$5,000.00 retainer to Attornoy
  Cousinoau subject to argument, at a later date, concerning contribution
  by mother."
- 3.) Shortly thereafter, the plaintiff father deposited the retainer set forth in said order.

4.) Said retainer was exhausted at the time the December 30, 2008 bill was sent to the parties.

υ

۹0 <del>:</del>ا

164

5.) The plaintiff made two partial payments of fees due in the amounts of\$50.00 in January of 2009 and \$100.00 in August of 2009.

6.) As of the date of this motion, the undersigned has an outstanding balance in the amount of \$8,978.50.

WHEREFORE, the undersigned respectfully requests that this court enter orders to provide for payment of the guardian ad litem fees in excess of the original retainer.

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED Sue A. Cousineau Guardian ed litem for the minor children

516 MAIN STREET, SUITE 25, MIDDLETOWN, CT 06457 - Juris # 411109 - Telephone (860)346-1783 - Fax (860)346-1785 LAW OFFICE OF SUE A. COUSINEAU

DOCKET #	MMXFA-05-4002759-S	::	SUPERIOR COURT
SCOTT EIGN	VER	::	J.D. OF MIDDLETOWN
VS.		**	AT MIDDLETOWN
ANDREA CO	DTA EIGNER	••	February 1, 2011

#### MOTION FOR ORDER TO PAY GUARDIAN AD LITEM FEES

The undersigned guardian ad litem for the subject minor child respectfully avers the following:

- 1. She is the guardian ad litem for the subject minor child.
- 2. On or about October 8, 2009, the court entered orders regarding payment of the guardian ad litem's fees to that date. The order provided for each parent to pay a percentage of the fees, but did not specify a time for which payment should be made.
- 3. The plaintiff has paid his balance in full while the defendant has an outstanding balance due in the amount of \$3,949.37. (See attached affidavit of fees)
- 4. From the date of that order to present, the undersigned has incurred additional fees in the amount of \$2,175.00 for which there is no order. (See attached affidavit of fees)
- 5. Upon information and belief, the undersigned avers that each party has the ability to pay the fees of the guardian ad litem. While the defendant does not have an income, she has a substantial asset in the marital home.

DOCKET #	MMXFA-05-4002759-S	::	SUPERIOR COURT
SCOTT EIGI	VER	::	J.D. OF MIDDLETOWN
VS.		::	AT MIDDLETOWN
ANDREA CO	OTA EIGNER	**	February 1, 2011

#### AFFIDAVIT OF FEES

The undersigned being duly sworn deposes and says:

1. She is over the age of 18 and believes in the obligation of an oath,

2. She makes this affidavit from personal knowledge,

3. She is the Guardian ad litem for the minor child in the above captioned matter

4. As Guardian ad litem, I have incurred 56.55 hours of time at a rate of \$250.00 which

equals \$14,137.50 from the start of the case to the previous orders of October 2009 of which Mr. Eigner has paid \$10,093.13 and Ms. Cota has paid \$95.00. The outstanding balance due from Ms. Cota per the October 2009 court order is \$3,949.37. Additionally, I have incurred 7.25 hours at a rate of \$300.00 which equals \$2,175.00 from the previous orders to present for which there are no current orders.

Cousineau She A.

Guardian ad litem

Sworn to and subscribed before me on February/2, 2011 Commissioner of the Superior Court

WHEREFORE, the undersigned respectfully requests that this honorable Court order the defendant to immediately pay the undersigned the balance of \$3,949.37. WHEREFORE, the undersigned respectfully requests that this honorable court enter orders regarding the additional fees in the amount of \$2,175.00.

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED,

516 Main St. suite 24 Middletown. CT 06457 Juris # 306902 Tel: 860-346-1783 Fax: 860-346-1785

# Law Office of Sue A. Cousineau 516 Main Street, Suite 25

Middletown, Connecticut 06457

Ph: (860) 346-1783 Fax:(860) 346-1785

Justin Eigner 2 Riverview Place Cromwell, CT 06416

~ · <sup>4</sup> ·

20 - K

Oct 14, 2009

File #:	2479
Inv #:	2017

# RE: Eigner, Scott v Eigner, Andrea re: Justin dkt #FA05-4002759-S

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jan-29-09	Receipt and review of marking.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
Feb-03-09	Telephone Conference with Dr. Hiebel.	0.40	\$100.00	SAC
Feb-05-09	Receipt and review of vm from Attorney Adelman; return call left vm.	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
Feb-09-09	Receipt and Review of correspondence from Court.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
Feb-17-09	Receipt and review of evaluation.	1.30	\$325.00	SAC
Mar-05-09	Preparation of correspondence to counsel.	0.30	\$75.00	SAC
Mar-09-09	Receipt and review of reclaim.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
Mar-10-09	Telephone Conference with Dr. Hiebel.	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
Mar-31-09	Receipt and review of email exchange between parents.	0.40	\$100.00	SAC
Apr-06-09	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Shainess.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
Apr-13-09	Telephone Conference with Attorney Shainess.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
Apr-23-09	Receipt and review of motion.	0.30	\$75.00	SAC
Apr-27-09	Receipt and review of reclaim.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
Apr-30-09	Receipt and review of email exchange between father and school.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC

· · · M	ay-07-09	Receipt and review of marking.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
	ay-08-09	Receipt and review of motion.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
М	ay-12-09	Receipt and Review of correspondence from	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
		Court. Office Consultation with S. Eigner; listen to	1.00	\$250.00	SAC
Μ	lay-14-09	taped telephone calls; memo to file. Receipt and review of motion.	0.40	\$100.00	SAC
Ν	1ay-19-09	Receipt and review of email exchange re: visitation.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
N	1ay-22-09	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Adelman.	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
N	4ay-26-09	Travel to and attend court.	1.50	\$375.00	SAC
N	/lay-27-09	Telephone Conference with Dr. Hiebel.	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
J	un-01-09	Receipt and review of vm from Attorney DiMarco; tc to Attorney DiMarco; preparation	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
J	un-02-09	email to Attorney DiMarco. Receipt and review of multiple vm from Attorney DiMarco.	0.20		SAC
J	un-03-09	Receipt and review of reclaim.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
		Telephone Conference with Dr. Hiebel.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
	Tun-11-09	Receipt and review of motion.	0.30		SAC
	Jul-06-09	Receipt and Review of correspondence from Court.	0.10		SAC
	Jul-13-09	Receipt and review of multiple motions.	0.80		SAC
	Jul-14-09	Receipt and review of reclaim.	0.10		SAC
	Jul-20-09	Receipt and review of multiple motions.	0.35	\$ \$87.50	SAC
	Jul-25-09	Receipt and review of motion.	0.25	5 \$62.50	SAC
	Jul-28-09	Receipt and review of marking.	0.10	) \$25.00	SAC
	Aug-03-09	Receipt and review of reclaim.	0.10	) \$25.00	SAC
	Aug-08-09	Receipt and review of reclaim	0.1	0 \$25.00	SAC
	Aug-10-09	Officer Cogut.	0.5	_	SAC
		Receipt and review of reclaim.	0.1	0 \$25.00	SAC

÷

	Listen to CD of taped telephone calls between mother and minor child; memo to file re: same.	2.30	\$575.00	SAC
Aug-12-09	Receipt and review of marking.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
Aug-17-09	Travel to and attend Court.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
Aug-20-09	Receipt and review of motion.	0.70	\$175.00	SAC
• Aug-24-09	Travel to and attend court.	2.40(	\$600.00	SAC
Aug-25-09	Receipt and review of motion.	0.30	\$75.00	SAC
Aug-27-09	Receipt and review of multiple motions.	0.60	\$150.00	SAC
Sep-02-09	Office Consultation with S. Eigner.	0.50	\$125.00	SAC
	Preparation of correspondence to Dr. Hiebel.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
Sep-03-09	Receipt and review of motion.	0.15	\$37.50	SAC
Sep-09-09	Draft motion for continuance; telephone call to counsel and pro se party; file motion.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
	Receipt and review of AMPS report.	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
Sep-10-09	Preparation of correspondence to Attorney DiMarco.	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
	Receipt and review of multiple motions.	0.60	\$150.00	SAC
	Memo to file re: hang-up call from Ms. Cota-Eigner's telephone number; attempted	0.10	\$25.00	SAC
$\subset$	return call. Telephone Conference with Joan from AMPS re: visitation.	0.60	\$150.00	SAC
Sep-11-09	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Adelman.	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
Sep-14-09	Receipt and review of Motion.	0.20	\$50.00	SAC
Sep-15-09	Research re: pending motions.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
Sep-17-09	Receipt and review of email correspondence.	0.25	\$62.50	SAC
	Receipt and review of vm from J. Johnson - Human Services Investigator, memo to file;	0.35	\$87.50	SAC
Sep-22-09	return call left vm. Receipt and review of motion.	0.15	\$37.50	SAC
Sep-23-09	Receipt and review of extensive vm from Donald Polansky	0.40	\$100.00	SAC
Sep-25-09	Receipt and review of correspondence from Attorney Adelman.	0.10	\$25.00	SAC

• •

	Telephone call to Attorney DiMarco, left vm.	0.10 \$25.00	SAC
	Telephone Call to Dr. Hiebel, left vm.	0.20 \$50.00	SAC
Sep-27-09	Receipt and review of vm from Dr. Hiebel.	0.25 \$62.50	SAC
Sep-28-09	confrence with Attorney DiMarco.	0.20 \$50.00	SAC
Sep-29-09	Telephone Conference with Attorney Adelman.	0.30 \$75.00	SAC
	Telephone Conference with clerk's office.	0.20 \$50.00	SAC
Oct-02-09	Telephone Conference with A. Cota-Eigner.	0.30 \$75.00	> SAC
	Receipt and review of evaluation.	0.60 \$150.00	SAC
	Review file re: preparation for hearing.	1.50 \$375.00	SAC
Oct-05-09	Travel to and attend court.	6.00 \$1,500.00	) SAC
Oct-06-09	Receipt and review of email from S. Eigner; Telephone Conference with Scott Eigner; Telephone Conference with Det. Vandersloot;	0.40 \$100.00	SAC
Oct-08-09	telephone call to DCF,left vm Receipt and review of vm from Mr. Johnson, investigator.	0.20 \$50.00	SAC
Oct-09-09	Receipt and review of Memorandum of Decision.	0.35 \$87.50	SAC
Oct-14-09	Receipt and review of multiple vm from A. Cota-Eigner re: telephone contact; Telephone Conference with AMPS; telephone call to A.	0.40 \$100.00	SAC
	Cota-Eigner re: telephone contact. Telephone Conference with S. Cojito, DCF supervisor.	0.20 \$50.00	SAC
	Totals	34.45 \$8,612.50	
	Total Fees, Disbursements	- • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	\$8,612.50
	Previous Balance		\$475.00
	Previous Payments		\$100.00
	Balance Due Now		\$8,987.50

••••

# TRUST STATEMENT

		Disbursements	Receipts
Oct-08-08	Received From: Scott Eigner Retainer		5,000.00
Oct-10-08	Paid To: Law Office of Sue A. Cousineau Payment for invoice: 1931	3,950.00	
Dec-30-08	Paid To: Law Office of Sue A. Cousineau Payment for invoice: 1944	1,050.00	
	Total Trust	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00
	Trust Balance		\$0.00

1

•

NO: MMX-FA05-4002759S	: SUPERIOR COURT	
SCOTT EIGNER	: JUDICIAL DISTRICT OF MIDDLESEX	
v.	: AT MIDDLETOWN, CONNECTICUT	
ANDREA EIGNER	: AUGUST 12, 2013	
~		
BEFORE THE HONORABLE	GERARD I. ADELMAN, JUDGE	
APPEARANCES:		
Representing the Defendant:		
ANDREA EIGNER, Self-Represented Litigant		
Former Guardian ad Litem:		
ATTORNEY SUE COUSINEAU		
	Recorded By: Carrie Bogdan	
	Transcribed By:	
	Carrie Bogdan Court Recording Monitor	
	1 Court Street Middletown, CT 06457	
1		

s c

THE COURT: All right, number 52, Eigner versus 1 Eigner. 2 ATTY. COUSINEAU: They're getting Mrs. Eigner 3 from the hall, Your Honor. She's approaching. 4 5 For the record, Sue Cousineau, I was the guardian ad litem in this matter. This is my request 6 for a status conference concerning fees due me from 7 8 Mrs. Eigner. All right. 9 THE COURT: Excuse me, Your Honor, since I have 10 MS. EIGNER: a Federal lawsuit in on you I think that you need to 11 12 recuse yourself. I'm not aware of a Federal lawsuit. THE COURT: 13 MS. EIGNER: You've been served. 14 I've never been served. 15 THE COURT: MS. EIGNER: Attorney Jane Rosenberg is handling 16 17 your case. ATTY. COUSINEAU: Your Honor, I think what Mrs. 18Eigner is referring to is she has a Federal lawsuit. 19 I think she moved to amend the suit to include you, 20 I don't think that has been ruled on yet. That's my 21 read of the docket. 22 THE COURT: I'm just, I've never been notified 23 24 of --Right. ATTY. COUSINEAU: 25 MS. EIGNER: It went in months ago. When you 26 told me I couldn't talk about my son to God. 27

1 THE COURT: Well, why don't you fill out a 2 financial affidavit so the Court can make an 3 appropriate ruling based on ---4 MS. EIGNER: But I still feel that I shouldn't 5 have to pay someone who aided in the illegal kidnapping of my son and she's a disgrace and a 6 7 serious liability to our society and she should be 8 disbarred from her position as GAL and attorney and 9 she will be very shortly. One way or another. 10 Well, ma'am, why don't you fill out THE COURT: 11 your financial affidavit and bring it back in and the 12 Court will consider your situation. 13 ATTY. COUSINEAU: And Your Honor, just to point 14 out, I think the orders were already entered in 2008 so it's not we're asking you to enter orders for the 15 16 fees. 17 (Family Short Calendar continues, not required 18 for transcription.) THE COURT: All right. 52, Eigner versus 19 20 Eigner. 21 ATTY. COUSINEAU: For the record, Sue Cousineau, 22 guardian ad litem, former guardian ad litem. 23 All right. Now, in the abundance of THE COURT: 24 fairness, Ms. Eigner let me point out to you that, as 25 I did earlier this morning, but in more detail, under 26 our Connecticut Practice Book Section 1-22(b) that 27 once a judicial authority is made aware that there is